
The Night Owls 
STAY UP LATE IN BERKSHIRE 

Look out for further details on Facebook and The Ark website!  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

This month’s meet up will 
be on the 18th January 
2020. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

We will be having a movie 
night! 
The film and time are to be 
confirmed.  
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

We will be going to 
Bracknell Cineworld.  
 

 

We will meet at The Bull 
pub in the bar area at 7pm. 
 
We can get a drink 
together and decide what 
films we want to see.  

https://www.tripadvisor.co.uk/Restaurant_Review-g227124-d2001481-Reviews-The_Bull_Bracknell-Bracknell_Berkshire_England.html


The Night Owls 
STAY UP LATE IN BERKSHIRE 

Look out for further details on Facebook and The Ark website!  

 

 We can buy the tickets 
together when everyone 
has arrived so we can sit 
as a group. 
 
Some of us may want to 
see different films. This is 
okay too.  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 

A Ticket will cost £9.85.  
 
Bring extra money if you 
want snacks and a drink at 
the cinema.  
 
And your CEA card if you 
have one.  

   You are welcome to bring 
a friend or carer but 
remember they need a 
ticket! 
 

 
 

Please let us know if you 
will be coming or if you 
have any questions regard 
transport by contacting 
The Ark by telephone 
01344 266899 or by email 
info@theark.org.uk  
 

DON’T FORGET TO GET INTOUCH TO JOIN OUR TRIP TO 

LONDON FOR THE THEATRE IN FEBRUARY AS SOON AS 

YOU CAN!  

https://www.google.com/url?sa=i&rct=j&q=&esrc=s&source=images&cd=&cad=rja&uact=8&ved=2ahUKEwjF6J2Z_PThAhURhxoKHcJMBBAQjRx6BAgBEAU&url=https://www.peoplefirstinfo.org.uk/health-and-well-being/easy-read-information-for-people-with-learning-disabilities/relationships/&psig=AOvVaw1JdECSZssdGKEe_SBIwF8T&ust=1556615880936127
mailto:info@theark.org.uk
https://www.borntoloaf.co.uk/freecinema.php
https://www.google.com/url?sa=i&rct=j&q=&esrc=s&source=images&cd=&ved=2ahUKEwiD66SS2u7mAhW1BWMBHW2QBJMQjRx6BAgBEAQ&url=https://www.cineworld.co.uk/popcorn-and-drinks&psig=AOvVaw3E49a0RgRvexS-SGrKgmz6&ust=1578390812938741

